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38th Committee On Rules <committeeonrules@guamlegislature.gov>
IPEGISTHARVRIE

Messages and Communications for 38GL-25-0378*
2 messages

Speaker Frank Blas Jr. <speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov> Wed, Apr 2, 2025 at 10:20 AM
To: committeeonrules@guamlegislature.gov, Office Senator Bri <office.senatorbri@guamlegislature.gov>

Hafa Adai,

Please see attached M&C Doc. No. 38GL-25-0378

Prior Years Obligation to pay South Pacific Petroleum Corporation in the total amount
38GL-25-0378 Department of Youth Affairs of $632.50*

Si Yu'os Ma'ase’,

Bewice Rivera
Administrative Assistant

Office of Speaker Frank F. Blas, Jr.

I Mina’trentai Ocho na Liheslaturan Guihan 38t Guam Legislature

Guam Congress Building, 163 Chalan Santo Papa, Hagatiia

(671)969-6456
speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov

Electronic Privacy Notice: This e-mail and any attachment(s), contains information that is, or may be, covered by electronic communications privacy laws and
legal privileges, and is also confidential and proprietary in nature. If you are not the intended recipient, please be advised that you are legally prohibited from
retaining, using, copying, distributing, or otherwise disclosing the information in this e-mail or any attachment in any manner. Instead, please reply to the
sender that you have received this communication in error, and then immediately delete it. Thank you in advance for your cooperation.

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Annie Rodriguez <annie.rodriguez@dya.guam.gov>
Date: Tue, Apr 1, 2025 at 3:21 PM

Subject: Prior Year Obligation Payment Request

To: <speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov>

Cc: Jennifer R. Arceo <jennifer.arceo@dya.guam.gov>

Hafa Adai,

P.L. 37-125 allows for the payment of Prior Years' obligations. The invoice submitted is for $632.50, which the DYA will process for payment
against our general fund account. Please let me know when you receive this email notification to pay a prior year obligation. Thank you.

Respectfully,

Apwnnie C. Rodrigueg
Telephone: 671-735-5011
Fax: 671-734-7536

2 attachments

ﬂ D252000-043 SPPC.pdf
221K

-3 38GL-25-0378.pdf
1149K

Doc. No. 38GL-25-0378.*
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committeeonrules@guamlegislature.gov <committeeonrules@guamlegislature.gov>

To: "Speaker Frank Blas Jr." <speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov>

Hafa Adai!

Received and thank you.

Marie Crisostomo

Si Yu'os ma’dse’,

Committee on Rules Assistant

COMMITTEE ON RULES

Vice Speaker V. Anthony Ada, Chairperson

I Mina’trentai Ocho Na Liheslaturan Gudhan

38" Guam Legislature

Wed, Apr 2, 2025 at 10:30 AM

Disclaimer: The content of this email is intended for the person or entity to which it is addressed only. This email may
contain confidential information. If you are not the person to whom this message is addressed, be aware that any use,
reproduction, or distribution of this message is strictly prohibited. If you received this in error, please contact the sender at

committeeonrules@guamlegislature.gov_and immediately delete this email and any attachments.

From: Speaker Frank Blas Jr. <speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, April 2, 2025 10:20 AM
To: committeeonrules@guamlegislature.gov; Office Senator Bri <office.senatorbri@guamlegislature.gov>
Subject: Messages and Communications for 38GL-25-0378*

Hafa Adai,

Please see attached M&C Doc. No. 38GL-25-0378

38GL-25-0378

Department
of Youth
Affairs

Prior Years
Obligation
to pay
South
Pacific
Petroleum
Corporation
in the total
amount of
$632.50*
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Si Yu'os Ma'ase',

Bernice Rivera
Administrative Assistant

Office of Speaker Frank F. Blas, Jr.

I Mina’trentai Ocho na Liheslaturan Guéhan 38" Guam Legislature
Guam Congress Building, 163 Chalan Santo Papa, Hagatiia

(671)969-6456
speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov

Electronic Privacy Notice: This e-mail and any attachment(s), contains information that is, or may be, covered by electronic communications privacy laws and
legal privileges, and is also confidential and proprietary in nature. If you are not the intended recipient, please be advised that you are legally prohibited from
retaining, using, copying, distributing, or otherwise disclosing the information in this e-mail or any attachment in any manner. Instead, please reply to the
sender that you have received this communication in error, and then immediately delete it. Thank you in advance for your cooperation.

[Quoted text hidden]
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Y Speaker Frank Blas Jr. <speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov>
RE GISTFARYRIE

Prior Year Obligation Payment Request
2 messages

Annie Rodriguez <annie.rodriguez@dya.guam.gov> Tue, Apr 1, 2025 at 3:21 PM

To: speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov
Cc: "Jennifer R. Arceo" <jennifer.arceo@dya.guam.gov>

Hafa Adai,
P.L. 37-125 allows for the payment of Prior Years' obligations. The invoice submitted is for $632.50, which the DYA will

process for payment against our general fund account. Please let me know when you receive this email notification to pay
a prior year obligation. Thank you.

Doc Type: 38GL-25-0378

Respectfully,

OFFICE OF THE SPEAKER
Apnnie C. Rodriguez FRANK F. BLAS, JR.
Telephone: 671-735-5011 Apr. 1, 2025
Faxe: 671-734-7536 Time: 3:21 PM

Received&

E D252000-043 SPPC.pdf
221K

Speaker Frank Blas Jr. <speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov> Tue, Apr 1, 2025 at 3:28 PM
To: Annie Rodriguez <annie.rodriguez@dya.guam.gov>
Cc: "Jennifer R. Arceo" <jennifer.arceo@dya.guam.gov>

Yes, | received it.

Speaker, Frank F. Blas, Jr.

I Mina’trentai Ocho na Liheslaturan Guahan 38" Guam Legislature

38GL-25-0378

Messages and Communications

Guam Congress Building, 163 Chalan Santo Papa, Hagatiia

(671)969-6456 RECEIVED
i COMMITTEE ON RULES
speakerblas@guamlegislature.gov April 2, 2025
. 10:20 a.m.
Mowre Crisostomo-

Electronic Privacy Notice: This e-mail and any attachment(s), contains information that is, or may be, covered by electronic
communications privacy laws and legal privileges, and is also confidential and proprietary in nature. If you are not the intended
recipient, please be advised that you are legally prohibited from retaining, using, copying, distributing, or otherwise disclosing the
information in this e-mail or any attachment in any manner. Instead, please reply to the sender that you have received this
communication in error, and then immediately delete it. Thank you in advance for your cooperation.

[Quoted text hidden]
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GOVERNMENT OF GUAM
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION
FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT SYSTEM

REQUEST FOR
DIRECT PAYMENT

DOCUMENT NO.: D252000-043
E URGENT - EXPEDITE PAYMENT D KEY & RELEASE-AS AP DATE: 03.28.25
PAYEE: VENDOR NUMBER:
South Pacific Petroleum Corporation
816 N Marine Corps Drive FL2
Tamuning, Guam 96913-4431 V0001632
| PURFOSE: Request for payment of Invoice No.. 48657 in the amount of $632.50. This is a prior year invoice and payment of this

invoice was inadvertently overseen and goods were received on this invoice.

g =
TRAN ACCOUNT INVOICE
CODE NUMBER AMOUNT NUMBER / MONTH DATE

180 _ $ 632.50 | 48657/ September 2024 0328.25

TOTAL: | $ 632.50
CHECK APPROPRIATE BOX BELOW.
ACCOUNT NUMBER IS CORRECT [x} 0B ORDER NUMBER IS CORRECT |:| INSUFFICIENT FUNDS
[_] PRIOR REFERENCE IS CORRECT [“x] vENDOR NUMBER is CORRECT
[ ] oveRRIDE Is AUTHORIZED [ "X ] SUFFICIENT FUNDS

|I] | CERTIFY THAT GOODS/SERVICES SPECIFIED HAVE BEEN RECEIVED AND THAT PAYMENT IS PROPER AS PER THE ATTACHED DOCUMENTS

I:I | CERTIFY THAT A VALID LIABILITY EXIST BY REASON OF WITHHOLDINS
ATTACHED DOCUMENTS

RPAYMENT OR DEPOSIT AND THAT PAYMENT IS PROPER AS PER THE

Annie Rodriguez, DCCII 28-Mar-25
PREPARED BY Date
Melanie W. Brennan, Director 3’ 2§28
APPROVING OFFIGIAL Date

Jennifer R. Arceo, Admin Officer
CERTIFICATION OF FUNDS AVAILABLE

Form ACC-DPAO01 Revised 07-2017 T

@'cﬁfﬂ:om

Doc. No. 38GL-25-0378.*



DIPATTAMENTON ASUNTON MANHOBEN
Government of Guam

LOURDES A. LEON GUERRERO P.O. Box 33672 MLLANll)Eng[?RENNAN
JOSHUA E. TENORIO Barrigada, Guam 96921 MICHAFL D WEAKLEY
Lt Govemor Tel: (671) 735-5010 Fax: (671) 734-7536 Deputy Director
March 31, 2025
MEMORANDUM
TO: 38" Guam Legislature
Office of the Speaker
FROM: Director

SUBJECT:  Prior Year Payment Request

Hafa Adai, please be advised that the Department of Youth Affairs received invoice 48657 for
$632.50, which was not transmitted to DOA promptly for payment. This invoice would have been
charged against the authorized purchase order number P246A00892. Please be advised that the
department received the goods on this invoice, and payment will be made from DYA’s FY2025
general fund account number 6240001.100.25.2030002.

Your approval in this matter will be greatly appreciated.

Kon Respetu,

For o betler Tormorrow !

Doc. No. 38GL-25-0378.*
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SPPC

South Pecific Petroteurn Carporation

DHE.S

Tel. No: (671) 647-7600 « Fax: (671) 588-7202 « 816 North Marine Corps Dr. Fl 2, Tamuning, Guam 96913-4431 « Website: T6eirclekguam.com

“Y P20 /32

*** INVOICE ***

DEPT OF YOUTH AFFAIRS acct+ [N

PO BOX 23672

GMF, GU 96921 9/30/24
DATE REF # DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

9/30/24 48657 LPG Direct Sa 110.0 GAL®@5.7500 632.50
PO #P246A00892

< INVOICE TOTAL > 632.50

PAYMENT TERMS:

INVOICE AMOUNT OF $632.50 DUE BY 10/30/24,
MAIL CHECK PAYMENT TO:

816 NORTH MARINE CORPS DRIVE FL 2
TAMUNING, GUAM 96913-4431

C VIO

Adnounistrpt
A fnance charge of 1.5% per month wil actrue on past due balances. In case of defauit, customer is responsible for all colection agency ana

and any other expenses incurred o recover sudh debt.
Prepared by: Checked and Approved by

Mid-Distillate Health Statement
Skippaint‘ngﬁo&swsmﬂdedbyﬂlaﬁohmmwswmnwﬁacﬁmsdeﬁmmaudemauaadedmds,mbuﬁqbemmm?wdegﬂﬂs-
370 deg C}, have chowm that thece middle dictilate matenials usually produced tumors andior cancers in laboratory mice. The recponse was judged to be weak to
moderated with a relatively long latent period. The relationship of these results to humans has not been fully estabiiched However, potential fsks to humans can be
nmenimized by observing good work practices and personal hygiene procedures generally recommended for all petrolevmn products. These procedures incdude minimizing
inhalation of vapoes and mists, reducing skin contact as well as washing skin with soap and water after contact before breaks and meats and at the end of the work period.

Doc. No. 38GL-25-0378.*
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PURCHASE ORDER TRAN CODE
GENERAL SERVICES AGENCY 5
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATION H45 PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER
GOVERNMENT OF GUAM No. rz46a00892
148 Route | APPEAR ON ALL NYOICES
Pm&{lame Dgggz 5 EA%KN&&&PDSE Pl(\: KA GES
FoD. ARUTREIGH] Tt CONTACT [SHIP ViA: I OATE xnomxana AL
L7 t[ : / / 11/08/2023| 20302400224
L/&/'-/ = Q /‘3 ’Zj | PEPMO-GHOW SHPANG | mARGES AS SEPARAIE HEM G ) 240 |

SOUTH PACIFIC PETROLEUP CORP.

816 N BARINE CORPY DR FL 2

TAHUNING, CU 96913-4431

R Telephone: 671 S88-7200 Fax:
Email:

VENDOR
30097594

ICONIGNEE DESINARCN & MARIGNG
H PEPARTEENT OF YOUTH AFTAIRS

671 588-7202

J 169 SAN ISIDRO STREET
PP.o. BOX 23872
ARRIGADA, GNF, GU 96921-0000

OpIv Or voC REMAB ¢ SUPPRT SVCS

¥k INVITATION NO

Wk CONTRACT NO TME FORDELVERY  [EXPINING
ZE BELOW
- ——— —m st o B

lfscouulunwm

ARTNICLES OF SEMVICES

Mol _

UNIT UNF PRICE

AMOUNT POCUMENT NUMBER

1|ISSUED TO COVER THE COST FOR

PETROLEUR GAS, LPG GAS REFILL
To be drasn on an as needed

basis commencing upon receipt
of purchase order and expiring
09/30/24 or upon exhaustion of
funds, vhichever occurs firac,

800 Gallons §%5.24 = $4,192.00
250 GALLON EXISTING GAS TANK
LOCATED AT DYA NANGILAO
COHPOUND .

Auth,. Personnel: Jespe Guzman,
Anita Ignacio, Jay Cruz, James
Fachal, Annie Rodriguez
671-735-5047

|NOTE:
THE GOVERNHENT OF GUANM WILL NOT BE
Naoce:

IPON
may
to ¢

Apounts due this Purchase Orde
of Guam inclusive of but not limite

1| LOT

he of
xey, fties,

and ¢

4192.000

FIBLE FOR 'U'NAIJTHOR{ZED‘
set for mon

4192.00 242030012
!

i
|
— b

PURCHASES OR SERVICES.
Ies due the Government
ecurned checks plus for

other damages, penalvies, and Attor
To be coordinated betveen the agenc
ALL LATZ DELIVERIES AND ACCEPTANCES
610119} (a) OF THE GAR.

y's fees,
and fendor

RE SyBJECT|TO THE LIQUIFATID DAMAGES

tter farlure to pay

CLAUSE IN SECTIDN

accordingly;

UPECIAL INSTRUCTION 5 70 YEMNDOR:
B, HND CERTHED QRIGINAL AND THRIE (1) COMES OF
GOVERNMENT OF GUAM, 2.0 90X 84, AGANA, GUAN 94910

DEPAATHEHT OF ADMING IRATION,

€ PAYMENT I THIRTT {30) DAYS UPON AECEIPT OF MERCHANDIE IN CUAM N G000 CONDRTIIN

0. THE ORDEA SURECT TO CONDITIONS ON RFVERSE SIDE

E % 3% TH5 OADER B SUBKC T 1O THE SPECIAL SRONTIONS, AND BID GENERAL TERIS AND CONDITIONS SPECIRED OM THES 8D,
F. &5 ON ALL AL SHIPHENTS HAVE AR TREIGHT COMPANT CALL Te8S NUMBER UPOM ALRIVAL OF GOOOS

B GUAM,

CONTRACTOR PLEASE SUPPLY PROMPTLY THE ABOVE ARTICLES ON
SERVICES. ALL CONRESPONDENCE PERTAING TO THI3 ORDER INCLUDING
INVOICES, SHIFPING DOCUMERTS lﬂﬂ 9“8!6“ MUST BEAR THE
PURCHASE QROEN NUMBER 1HOWH

IEE AEVEASE SIDE FOR PURCHASE Olotl Ttllﬂ !ID CONBITLONS

Control No.

4192.00

A DY NGT FIEE THI5 ORDKL

{F YOUR TOTAL COSI
EXCEEDS (1] 153 TOIAL

-t —cm

INVERS £ IARIGFS AND AFTURN
1, OIDER TOR AMENDMEFH

ADMANCE PATHENT
AUTHONZANON |- g ntetana- Gruitugus — _ ActingCPD
PAYMENT
SO NAME TITLE
B = =i

ORIGINAL/VENDOR'S COPY
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